

# RECEIVED By Deana Y. Watson at 4:49 pm, Apr 16, 2018

Vendor #15182 PO #18-13381 816 Congress Avenue, Suite 1900 Austin, Texas 78701 Telephone: (512) 322-5800 Facsimile: (512) 472-0532

www.lglawfirm.com

April 10, 2018

Director Don Laffere c/o Marc Friberg Executive Director Edwards Aquifer Authority 900 E Quincy San Antonio, TX USA 78215

Invoice: Signature Client:

97491155 3949

Matter:

0

Billing Attorney: MAG

## **INVOICE SUMMARY**

For professional services and disbursements rendered through March 31, 2018:

RE: UCUWCD, et al v EAA

Professional Services Total Disbursements

\$ 6,126.00 \$ 11.60

TOTAL THIS INVOICE

\$ 6,137.60

Laffere, Director Don UCUWCD, et al v EAA I.D.3949-0-MAG April 10, 2018 Invoice: 97491155

## PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
3/01/18	MAG	Review incoming correspondence and proposed Rule 11 agreement; telephone call	.90
		with client regarding same; prepare response and revised Rule 11 agreement;	
		forward same to client.	
3/01/18	HEG	Case management.	.30
3/02/18	MAG	Respond to telephone call from client; telephone call with J. Katz; finalize and	.90
		dispatch letter; instructions and guidance to T. Brewer regarding drafting	
2/02/10	1440	answer/plea.	40
3/02/18	MAG	No Charge - Correspondence with client; correspondence with EAA senior	.40
		management and legal counsel regarding administrative issues and logistics of	
3/02/18	JTB	engagement. No Charge - Office conference with M. Gershon regarding answer and meeting	.20
3/02/10	JID	client's objectives.	.20
3/06/18	MAG	Multiple telephone calls among parties regarding settlement and Rule 11 agreement	1.20
3/00/10	141110	proposals; telephone call with client regarding same; review exchange of	
		correspondence among parties' legal counsel; follow up with client regarding same.	
3/06/18	JTB	Begin work on answer in EAA suit; review TRCP governing answers/pleas in	1.70
		abatement; review of relevant filings in case.	
3/09/18	MAG	Exchange correspondence with client.	.10
3/12/18	JTB	Pursue research regarding affirmative defenses and jurisdictional issues relevant to	2.60
		answer.	
3/13/18	JTB	Continued research regarding answer and possible pleas.	1.20
3/14/18	MAG	Review EAA's answers; coordinate with T. Brewer on drafting in light of client's	1.60
2/15/10	1440	instructions and goals in lawsuit; work on client's answer.	20
3/15/18	MAG	Review incoming correspondence and EAA's response to proposed Rule 11	.30
3/17/18	MAG	agreement; follow up with client regarding same.  Review incoming replies from plaintiffs; follow up with client regarding same.	.20
3/17/18	MAG	Review T. Brewer's research findings and revised draft answer; edit same.	2.20
3/19/18	MAG	Review correspondence from EAA to plaintiffs; follow up with client regarding	.20
3/17/10	WIZEG	same.	.20
3/20/18	MAG	Review incoming proposal on next steps regarding settlement from plaintiff's	.20
		counsel C. Romero; follow up with client regarding same; exchange correspondence	
		with C. Romero.	
3/21/18	JTB	Additional background research and drafting work on answer to UCUWCD v EAA	1.40
		lawsuit; review of Plaintiffs' Original Petition and petitions for intervention from	
		City and County for purposes of same.	
3/21/18	JTB	No Charge - Additional background research and drafting work on answer to	1.40
		UCUWCD v EAA lawsuit; review of Plaintiffs' Original Petition and petitions for	
2/20/10	N/40	intervention from City and County for purposes of same.	20
3/22/18	MAG	Review and follow up on settlement efforts and correspondence; sign and send Rule	.30

Laffere, Director Don UCUWCD, et al v EAA I.D.3949-0-MAG April 10, 2018 Invoice: 97491155

Date	Atty	Description Of Services Rendered	Hours
		11 agreement.	
3/23/18	MAG	Work on answer with T. Brewer.	.50
3/23/18	JTB	Work on D. Laffere answer; review of all of EAA answer filings to ensure	.60
		consistency therewith; work session with M. Gershon regarding same.	
3/23/18	JTB	No Charge - Work on D. Laffere answer; review of all of EAA answer filings to	.50
		ensure consistency therewith; work session with M. Gershon regarding same.	
3/23/18	HEG	Work with attorneys on client's answer due March 26; case management.	1.50
3/25/18	MAG	Review Texas Rules of Civil Procedure regarding verified pleas; finalize draft	.50
		answer and forward to client for final approval; additional follow-up regarding same.	
3/26/18	MAG	Work with H. Ging to finalize, file and serve answer; follow up with T. Brewer and	.30
		client regarding same.	
3/26/18	JTB	Review of M. Gershon revisions to answer; work session with M. Gershon on	1.10
		answer and filing logistics and research assignment; review of TX Supreme Court	
		holdings on doctrine of ultra vires suits	
3/26/18	JTB	No Charge - Review of M. Gershon revisions to answer; work session with M.	.70
		Gershon on answer and filing logistics and research assignment; review of TX	
		Supreme Court holdings on doctrine of ultra vires suits	
3/26/18	HEG	Finalize, file, and serve client's original answer.	.50
3/27/18	HEG	Case management regarding answer accepted by Uvalde County District Clerk's	.30
		Office.	
3/29/18	MAG	Review and follow up regarding client's written comments regarding EAA's key	.30
		points that may drive settlement.	
3/30/18	MAG	Telephone calls with client before and after meeting, and during lunch meeting	4.80
		break, and participate in meeting among litigant stakeholders; post-meeting	
		discussion with plaintiffs.	

## TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 6,126.00

## **SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

Name	Staff Level	Rate	Hours	Amount	N/C Hr	N/C \$
Michael A Gershon	Principal	250.00	14.50	3,625.00	.40	100.00
J Troupe Brewer	Associate	250.00	8.60	2,150.00	2.80	700.00
Hannah E Ging	<b>Paralegal</b>	135.00	2.60	351.00	.00	.00
TOTALS			25.70	\$ 6,126.00	3.20	\$ 800.00

## **DISBURSEMENTS**

			<del></del>
Date	Description		Amount
	Color Prints	·	3.00

# Lloyd Gosselink Rochelle & Townsend, P.C.

Laffere, Director Don UCUWCD, et al v EAA I.D.3949-0-MAG April 10, 2018 Invoice: 97491155

Date Description	Amount
Photocopying	8.60
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$ 11.60
TOTAL THIS INVOICE	\$ 6.137.60